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How To Choose The Best Baby Sitter

All You Need To Keep In mind When Hiring An After Hours Baby Sitter written by: xken004 

So the much anticipated social event or outing is finally here and you have successfully secured an 
after hours baby sitter who will make sure everything is well taken care of when you will be 
outside. However, does the caregiver have what it really takes to ensure you have peace of mind all 
through? Experts have always said crisis management and trust are the two key pillars the baby 
sitter should have.

Tips on how to find a great after hours baby sitter

Referrals/ recommendations

Seeking for recommendations and referrals from the people you trust is always the best place to 
start the search. Talk to friends and a couple of family members who have had the services of these 
caregivers before. With this, other than getting the one of the most trustworthy baby sitters, you 
would be surprised with the number of options you will have at the table.

Look through baby sitters website and organization

Organizations and websites offering these services are also some of the best places you can secure a
very good after hours baby sitter. Get your computer and you search for potential candidate around 
your area. The best part, through the internet, you can get access to thousands and thousands of 
online profiles right at the comfort of your home as you look for a potential pick. 

What to look for in baby sitter

From referrals ad online searches, at the end of the day, it is likely you will have a very long list. 
The next thing that you might want to do is to narrow it down to at least two or three candidates. At 
this point, a number of the factors will come into play. Below are a few of the factors that will 
largely determine whom you are going to hire for the job.

Experience

When it comes to baby sitting, experience is the key. How long has the baby sitter been in the 
market? Does he or she have the necessary skill for handling this challenging process? The answer 
to the above questions will in a way help you to make a very wise choice. However, at the end, 
make sure the bay sitter has been doing the same job for a very long time. After all, who would 
want an amateur baby sitter who would come and spoil everything and endanger the lives of the 
youngsters?

Female or male?

It is without any questions, female baby sitters are some of the best bets. Statistically, over 90 
percent of all the baby sitters in the market are all female. This is not surprising for women have 
and will always be good with the youngsters. Let a female sitter be your first choice.

What are your after-hours baby sitter beliefs?

Not all baby sitters will have the same belief as yours. Some will have very strong belief about 
issues touching on religion, children born out of wedlock among other things. At this pointing time, 
it would make a lot of sense if the person you pick for the task ahead holds beliefs that are in line 
with what you personally believe in. Many at times, it is always advisable you vet the baby sitter 
before he or she start the job; that will give you a very clear indication on what you should expect.

Working schedule



Scheduling is also very crucial when it comes to finding the most ideal after hours baby sitter. As a 
busy mum or dad, you need to find a person that can perfectly fit into your schedule and not the 
other way round. Ideally, before you even start the search, be sure to ask these questions as they will
play a key role when it comes to who has to be hired. 

Full time or part time? Do you need someone who can come late in the evening or very early the 
morning? Do you require a baby sitter who can stay late for after hours events? Clear answer to 
these questions will actually help you in finding the most appropriate after hours baby sitter.

What you need to put in place once you have secured a baby sitter

Once you have a person who is rightfully ripe for the job, on your part, you need to put in a place a 
few things for this new development.

Ground rules

Rules are everywhere and before the caregiver start to work you need to make him or her aware of 
your expectations. This is important so that you and baby sitter are on the same page. Some of the 
basic ground rules include; no invitation of guests into your home, no texting and calling friends 
and, of course, no taking of the kids away from the house unless a permission from you is first sort.

Routine 

Your child routine is essential and must be taken into great consideration. It is important the baby 
sitter knows your kid’s routine especially when the kid should be put to bed.

Food 

Depending largely on the time the caregiver works, as parent, it is recommended you provide food 
before you leave the house and if you have time, it would be great if you stock something for them 
first; besides, you can leave some money so that the baby sitter can order something.

Emergency number ad who to contact in case of anything

At the very least, the person you hire for the job should have your cell phone number and must 
know where you can be found in case of an emergency. Practically, if you have a complete list of all
the emergency contacts well set out in one lace, there is no way something would go wrong. 

Guaranteed pay

The baby sitter has made himself or herself available to work for you and most of them would want 
to be paid on time without any kind of delays. So before the sitter starts the job, it will make sense if
you agreed on terms of work and pay. If the services prove to be very expensive, talk it out with him
or her and you reach some sort of agreement before you put you put your signs on the contract.

Signs that will tell you have the best after hours baby sitter

If lately you have been having trouble identifying if you have the best baby sitter, here is a complete
list of all the signs that will tell you have the best.

Very engaging and shows a very strong and positive personality

Is he or she very friendly and effuse warmth? Is he or she very positive and eager to have the 
opportunity of taking care of your kids? If the person you choose depicts any of the signs, look no 
further for you have the best. Practically, a very strong and positive personality is one of the best 
clues that she or she will be fun with your kids, as well.



Ask relevant questions and eager to learn how you want thing run 

Your baby sitter will get an initial nod of approval if he or she asks relevant questions beforehand or
even during some of the first sessions. Wanting to know what your kid loves, what they dislike and 
other special preparations are great signs that the person really want to do a good job and give you 
the best.

Has completed basic first aid training course and other classes

With your baby sitter coming fully armed with a first aid training certificate, you cannot even start 
to imagine the kind of benefits you can net from that. Any good baby sitter is always prepared to 
make herself very marketable to families by willing to take any necessary training. So if you sitter 
has any of this training, that alone is a very clear indication he or she is very passionate about the 
whole process. Do no hesitate, but hire him or her.

Comes fully armed with the necessary materials for kids-friendly fun

Practically, some of the best after hours baby sitters will always come fully prepared for a lot of fun 
with the kids. Any enterprising caregiver may come with special story books or even a simple to 
complete craft (of course he or she will first seek for approval from the parents) In short, a good bay
sitter will always learn of great and simple ways on how he or she can win the hearts of the parents.

Your kids love him or her

After the first session, if your kids show some love and like for the baby sitter, that alone speak 
volumes. Besides, you can always ask your kids if there are comfortable with the caregiver. 

Comes dressed appropriately for a complete fun time

How your sitter dresses is important. After all, a person who would come dressed for a very hot date
is not going to want to play with the kids or have any kind of fun with the youngsters. The best baby
sitters will always come dressed not to impress, but to have some sort of kid-friendly fun with your 
kids. However, the dressing must be very conservative and extremely comfortable. 

Provides you with feedback

When it comes to baby sitting, being constantly updated on the progress by your baby sitter is 
highly advisable. Find someone who would be happy to tell you what he or she is doing with the 
kids when you are away. As a parent, you also need to keep an eye for any baby sitter who is not 
comfortable telling you what happened when the kids are present.

Keys Signs that you have a very baby sitter

For many parents, finding one of the best baby sitters is often a very challenging task. However, 
being very comfortable and confident that the one you have chosen will keep your kids happy and 
safe can, in a way, be unnerving. The following is a rundown of warning signs that you should get 
another caregiver. 

Does not seem to care or pays no attention to instructions you are giving

How you want things to be run while you are outside is basically the heart and soul of the whole 
process. Many at time, a very good baby will note all the instructions you give and acknowledge a 
thorough understanding. If you give an instruction and the caregiver does not seem to pay attention,
you need to worry. Ideally, it would make a lot of sense if you provide written instruction and the 
best baby sitter will take notes and able to recite the information back. 

Does not engage with you



Requiring your baby sitter to greet, smile and engage with you in a small talk is not too much to ask
of him or her. A good bay sitter will always ask you about the kids, converse and wish you a good 
time. If the person you hire does not show any of the signs, be sure he or she will do the same to 
your kid or kids. A major disconnect can in a way signal a clear lack of communication all around.

Invites other people to your house without prior permission from you

Many at times, there have reported cases of baby sitters gaining the confidence of the parents and in
turn feel more entitled to invite one or a number of his or her friends over. While this can help the 
caregiver in relieving nerves of being left alone with the kids, it is not always professional and 
totally out of line. After all, when this happens chances are; your kids will receive very less 
attention, as well as, interaction as the baby sitter will be busy talking and interacting with another 
person.

Your children wail when they are about to be left with the sitter

Technically, it not always unusual for the kids to not want to be apart from mom or even dad; 
however, if your kids start to show some emotional wreck when they are about to be left with the 
caregiver, you should actually have a second thought. Not only can this signify separation anxiety, 
but it could also signify something more serious.

Your kids start to show a change of behavior or change in sleep pattern

If your kid starts to wake up at night with terrors any a number of other sleep issues, that can be 
largely attributed to timing with a baby sitter and you should be concerned. As a parent, when you 
start to notice any change in behavior, you need to act as soon a possible. Take your time and you 
decisively and promptly determine if further investigation is actually needed.


